
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 18-4016

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Charter Bus Services

FOR:  

TIME & (June 1, 2018 through May 31, 2019)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., March 1, 2018
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

GROUP 1 MINI BUS UNIT

2 ea. PRICE 475.00 520.00  400.00

1. MINI-BUS 29 PASSENGER 4 HR, Lawson No. 22787 TOTAL 950.00 1,040.00 NO BID 800.00

 UNIT

 2 ea. PRICE 475.00 650.00  500.00

2. MINI-BUS 29 PASSENGER 5 HR, Lawson No. 22788 TOTAL 950.00 1,300.00 NO BID 1,000.00

 UNIT

1 ea. PRICE 570.00 780.00  600.00

3. MINI-BUS 29 PASSENGER 6 HR, Lawson No. 22789 TOTAL 570.00 780.00 NO BID 600.00

UNIT

2 ea. PRICE 665.00 910.00  700.00

4. MINI-BUS 29 PASSENGER 7 HR, Lawson No. 22790 TOTAL 1,330.00 1,820.00 NO BID 1,400.00

 UNIT

1 ea. PRICE 760.00 1,040.00  800.00

5. MINI-BUS 29 PASSENGER 8 HR, Lawson No. 33998 TOTAL 760.00 1,040.00 NO BID 800.00

 UNIT

1 ea. PRICE 855.00 1,170.00  900.00

6. MINI-BUS 29 PASSENGER 9 HR, Lawson No. 22792 TOTAL 855.00 1,170.00 NO BID 900.00

 

Sub Total for Group 1 TOTAL 5,415.00 7,150.00 NO BID 5,500.00

GROUP 2 PASSENGER BUSS 55 LARGER  UNIT

1 ea. PRICE 575.00 725.00 500.00 550.00

1. PASSENGER BUS 55 or LARGER 3 HR., Lawson No. 33968 TOTAL 575.00 725.00 500.00 550.00

  UNIT

1 ea. PRICE 575.00 725.00 500.00 550.00

2. PASSENGER BUS 55 or LARGER 5 HR., Lawson No. 33999 TOTAL 575.00 725.00 500.00 550.00

 UNIT

1 ea. PRICE 690.00 870.00 600.00 650.00

3. PASSENGER BUS 55 or LARGER 6 HR., Lawson No. 22797 TOTAL 690.00 870.00 600.00 650.00

UNIT

1 ea. PRICE 805.00 1,015.00 700.00 750.00

4. PASSENGER BUS 55 or LARGER 7 HR., Lawson No. 34000 TOTAL 805.00 1,015.00 700.00 750.00

  UNIT

12 ea. PRICE 920.00 1,160.00 800.00 850.00

5. PASSENGER BUS-55 or LARGER 8 HR., Lawson No. 34001 TOTAL 11,040.00 13,920.00 9,600.00 10,200.00

 UNIT

1 ea. PRICE 1,035.00 1,305.00 900.00 950.00

6. PASSENGER BUS-55 or LARGER 9 HR., Lawson No. 34002 TOTAL 1,035.00 1,305.00 900.00 950.00

 

      

 Sub Total for Group 2 TOTAL 14,720.00 18,560.00 12,800.00 13,650.00
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 18-4016

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Charter Bus Services

FOR:  

TIME & (June 1, 2018 through May 31, 2019)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., March 1, 2018
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY C
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GROUP 3 PASSENGER BUS 55 OR LARGER UNIT 5 hr min. 5 hr min. 5 hr min.  

Hour PRICE 115.00 145.00 500.00 550.00

1. PASSENGER BUS 55 or LARGER 3 HR., Lawson No. 33968 TOTAL 345.00 435.00 1,500.00 1,650.00

UNIT

Hour PRICE 115.00 145.00 500.00 550.00

2. PASSENGER BUSs 55 or LARGER 5 HR., Lawson No. 33999 TOTAL 575.00 725.00 2,500.00 2,750.00

 

      

Sub Total for Group 3 TOTAL 920.00 1,160.00 4,000.00 4,400.00

  *  

    

GRAND TOTAL TOTAL 21,055.00 26,870.00 16,800.00 23,550.00

EXTENSION 1 21,055.00

EXTENSION 2 21,055.00

EXTENSION 3  21,055.00

  Net Net Net Net

 Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

 

       

       

*LOW BIDDER       

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

City Tours, Inc. Regent Coachline SAWS Website

 Coach USA Star Shuttle

Daisy Tours Star Shuttle

 Imperial BUS Tuxedo Charters

Kerrville BUS Co. Valley Transit Co.

OK Tours
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